

# Fagen Friedman & Fulfroost, LLP

Blvd, Suite 1700  
 Los Angeles, CA 90048-5204  
 Telephone: 323-330-6300 Fax: 323-330-6311  
 Federal Tax ID: 42-1706595

Palo Alto Unified School District  
 Re: General Public Agency & Governance Matters  
 I.D. 258-00007 - LAS

January 31, 2014  
 Invoice # 33984-3  
 Case #: PO# BL-140418 Page #2

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
<b>Fees Detail</b>				
Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
01/03/14	DRM	Review of letter from Palo Alto Weekly regarding public record acts request and review of file for history.	0.60	129.00
01/03/14	LCV	Analysis of legal issues regarding public records requests.	0.20	45.00
01/03/14	CJG	Telephone and e-mail conferences with K. Skelly regarding District position on objection to denial of records request in OCR case #0-13-5901	0.60	165.00
01/06/14	DRM	Teleconference and strategy regarding Palo Alto Weekly PRA request response.	0.80	172.00
01/06/14	DRM	Research and analysis of Public Records Act and obligation to keep investigatory records confidential.	1.10	236.50
01/06/14	CJG	Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding District position on objection to denial of records request in OCR case #09-13-5901	1.20	330.00
01/09/14	LAS	Teleconference with L. Welp regarding redaction of letter of findings and follow up with K. Skelly.	0.30	82.50
01/09/14	LAS	Review correspondence from T. Hurley and respond.	0.30	82.50
01/13/14	DRM	Strategy and analysis regarding OCR investigation and Palo Alto Daily Public Records Act Request for FERPA protected records.	1.10	236.50
01/13/14	CJG	Telephone conference with K. Skelly regarding preparation for forthcoming meeting with OCR representatives on case #09-13-5901; Prepare for meeting and evaluate file information and research regarding same	1.80	495.00
01/13/14	LAS	Correspondence with L. Welp regarding redaction of letters of findings.	0.30	82.50
01/13/14	LAS	Review OCR letter of finding and discuss with H. Wade and C. Young.	0.40	110.00
01/14/14	DRM	Draft memorandum regarding Palo Alto Weekly Title IX PRA request.	0.60	129.00
01/14/14	DRM	Research Education Code 49076(c) permissive redaction provision in relation to PRA request.	0.40	86.00
01/14/14	CJG	Represent District at meeting with OCR representatives / and ; Attend pre-meeting with D. Tom, B. Mitchell and K. Skelly; Represent Board in closed session discussion of anticipated litigation matter; Draft statement on recent OCR decisions; Prepare for meetings and evaluate file information regarding same; Includes related travel	11.50	3,162.50
01/15/14	DRM	Draft letter to Palo Alto Weekly regarding District position on CPRA request and obligations under FERPA and California law.	1.50	322.50
01/15/14	CJG	Review and revise draft decision on uniform complaint alleging disability discrimination; Draft e-mail to C. Young and K. Baker regarding same; Telephone conference with C. Young regarding same and District position on finalization of decision; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding items for follow-up in OCR matters, including reply on request for records; Telephone conference with K. Skelly regarding same	6.20	1,705.00
01/16/14	CJG	Conduct legal research and evaluate file information for preparation of response to objection of denial of records request in OCR case 09-13-6901	2.10	577.50
01/17/14	DRM	Research and analysis of FOIA versus CPRA provisions on investigatory files.	0.60	129.00



# Fagen Friedman & Fulfroost, LLP

San Jose, CA 95128-3204

Phone: 323-330-4300 Fax: 323-330-6311

Federal Tax ID: 43-1708395

Palo Alto Unified School District

Re: General Public Agency & Governance Matters

ID: 258-00007 - LAS

January 31, 2014

Invoice # 33984-3

Case #: PO# BL-140418 Page #3

Date	Att	Description	Hours	Amount
01/17/14	CJG	Draft response to letter of objection to denial of records request in OCR case #09-13-6901; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding same; E-mail conferences with K. Skelly and C. Young regarding next steps in investigation and District position regarding same	6.80	1,870.00
01/20/14	CJG	Review and revise letter responding to letter of objection to denial of records request in OCR case # 09-13-6901; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding same; E-mail conference with K. Skelly and C. Young re: revised data request	4.80	1,320.00
01/20/14	LAS	Review letter to PA weekly regarding records request.	0.20	55.00
01/21/14	DRM	Review of response to Palo Alto Weekly CPRA request letter.	0.20	43.00
01/21/14	CJG	Finalize letter responding to letter of objection to denial of records request in OCR case # 09-13-6901; Telephone and e-mail conferences with K. Skelly regarding same and data request; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding same; Redact letters of findings in OCR cases #09-13-1195 and #09-13-1268; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding same	7.60	2,090.00
01/21/14	LAS	Further comments on letter regarding public records.	0.20	55.00
01/21/14	LAS	Strategy regarding redaction of OCR letters of findings.	0.20	55.00
01/21/14	LAS	Review redacted letters and strategy regarding same.	0.30	82.50
01/22/14	CJG	Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding OCR case #09-13-5901; Draft e-mail to K. Skelly regarding redactions in letters of finding for cases #09-13-1195 and #09-13-1268; Evaluate file information regarding same	2.40	660.00
01/23/14	CJG	E-mail conference with T. Kappeler Hurley regarding redaction of finding letters; Evaluate file information regarding same; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding OCR case #09-13-5901	1.80	495.00
01/24/14	CJG	Telephone conference with S. Bowers regarding data request in OCR case #09-13-5901; Conduct legal research and evaluate file information regarding same	1.20	330.00
01/27/14	CJG	Telephone conferences with C. Young regarding data request in OCR case #09-13-5901	0.30	82.50
01/29/14	CJG	Telephone conference with C. Young regarding data request in OCR case #09-13-5901; Telephone conference with K. Fox-Davis regarding same	0.30	82.50

**Total Fees 57.90 15,498.50**

**Recap - Actual Hourly Rate**

Name	Rate	Hours	Amount
L. Carlos Villegas	Associate	0.20	45.00
Lenore A. Silberman	Partner	2.20	605.00
David R. Mishook	Associate	6.90	1,483.50
Chad J. Gruff	Of-Counsel	48.60	13,365.00

**Totals 57.90 15,498.50**

**Disbursements Detail**

01/15/14	Computer Research; Westlaw Research	7.53
01/21/14	Computer Research; Westlaw Research	3.94

# Fagen Friedman & Fulfrost, LLP

1000 Blvd, Suite 1700  
 Palo Alto, CA 90048-5204  
 Phone: 323-330-6300 Fax 323-330-6311  
 Federal Tax ID: 42-1706595

Palo Alto Unified School District  
 Re: Communication Services

I.D. 258-00025 - LER

January 31, 2014

Invoice # 33784.4

Case #: PC09 01-140118 Page # 2

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
------	------	-------------	-------	--------

**Fees Detail**

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
------	------	-------------	-------	--------

01/09/14	TF	Reviewed and evaluated statement on OCR findings. [Courtesy Discount]	0.20	42.00
----------	----	---	------	-------

01/10/14	TF	Telephone meeting with communications manager regarding strategic timing and messages regarding recent OCR decision. [Courtesy Discount]	0.30	63.00
----------	----	--	------	-------

	<b>Total Fees</b>	<b>0.50</b>	<b>105.00</b>
--	-------------------	-------------	---------------

**Recap - Actual Hourly Rate**

Terilyn Finders	Communication Svcs Consultant	0.50	210.00	105.00
-----------------	-------------------------------	------	--------	--------

	<b>Totals</b>	<b>0.50</b>	<b>105.00</b>
--	---------------	-------------	---------------